CITY OF PALM SPRINGS, CALIFORNIA

MASTER BAIL SCHEDULE
(Updated May 28, 2020)

Code Section Description Violation Type Bail
PSMC 3.48.010 Unlawful to carry on business without a | Infraction 100.00
license.
PSMC 3.64.030 Showing of License required. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 3.64.040 Posting of Business License required. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.02.075 False Alarms Police — Permitted Alarm 15t in 365 days No Charge
(R23854) 2"din 365 days 150.00
34 in 365 days 200.00
4™ or more in 250.00
365 days
PSMC 5.02.075 False Alarms Police — Non-Permitted Alarm | 15t in 365 days No Charge
(R23854) 2" in 365 days 150.00
34 in 365 days 200.00
4™ or more in 250.00
365 days
PSMC 5.02.075 False Alarms Fire 15t in 365 days No Charge
(Ord. 1678) 2" in 365 days 240.00
39 in 365 days 240.00
4% in 365 days 240.00
5 or more 240.00
PSMC 5.02.075 Emergency Medical Alarms — Single Unit No Charge
(Ord. 1678)
PSMC 5.08.020 Soliciting of drinks. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.08.030 Entertainment not to be visible or audible | Infraction 50.00
from street. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.08.040 Solicitation of trade. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 2
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSMC 5.08.050 Locked doors. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.08.060 Hours of Entertainment. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.20.030 lllegal Posting of Handbills. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.20.040 Throwing Handbills in Public Places. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.20.050 Placing Commercial Handbills in or on | Infraction 50.00
Vehicles Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.20.060 Distribution of Handbills on uninhabited or | Infraction 50.00
vacant property. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.20.070 Distribution of Handbills where properly | Infraction 50.00
posted. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.20.080 Distribution on inhabited private premises | Infraction 50.00
not posted. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.20.090 Distributors License required — Handbills Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 5.22.020 Home Occupation — Business License | Infraction 75.00
required. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 5.22.030 Home Occupation — Permit required. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 5.22.050 Failure to comply with Home Occupation | Infraction 75.00
Regulations. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 5.28.010 Ice Vending Machines - Locations | Infraction 75.00
restricted. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 5.36.010 Selling Novelty Items at Special Events — | Infraction 75.00
Permit Required. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 5.38.070 Parking within spaces Infraction 31.00
PSMC 5.38.080 Improper Parking Position Infraction 31.00
PSMC 5.38.140 Expired Meter Infraction 31.00
PSMC 5.38.150 Valet Parking Permit Required Infraction 65.00
PSMC 5.38.170 Authorized Valet Zones Infraction 55.00

(MO 6299)

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 3
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail
PSMC 5.48.020 Peddlers or Solicitors — Application and | Infraction 75.00
license required. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 5.48.065 Solicitation within the Public Right-of-Way
(*R23206)
First Violation Infraction 100.00
Second Violation Infraction 250.00
Third Violation Misdemeanor 500.00
PSMC 5.58.010 Garage, Patio, Yard Sales — Residential | Infraction 50.00
Sales Prohibited. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.58.020 Garage, Patio, Yard Sales - Permit | Infraction 75.00
Required. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 5.58.050 Off-premises Signs Prohibited. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.60.020 Sales General — Permit Required. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.64.010 Searchlight Operation — Permit Required. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 5.64.020 Registration Required (Sound Truck). Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.04.020 Refuse Containers — Adequacy. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.04.030 Containers — Multiple Dwellings. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.04.040 Containers — Specifications Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.04.050 Containers — Sanitation. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.04.060 Containers — Domestic Capacity. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.04.070 Commercial Bins. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 4
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail
PSMC 6.04.080 lllegal Liquid Garbage Deposit. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.04.090 Kitchen Garbage — Drainage and | Infraction 50.00
Wrapping. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.04.110 lllegal Placing of Refuse in Streets. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 6.04.120 Unlawful Use of Public Trash Receptacles | Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 6.04.130 Improper Keeping of Refuse. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.04.200 Refuse Collection Service Mandatory. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 6.04.290 Commercial Solid Waste and Organic | Infraction
Waste Recycling for Businesses and Multi- | 15tin 365 days 100.00
Family Residential Dwellings 2" in 365 days 200.00
3" or more in 500.00
365 days
Misdemeanor 1,000.00
PSMC 6.08.010 Vacant Premises Maintenance. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 6.08.020 Unlawful Air Pollution. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 6.08.030 Mosquito Breeding Places. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 6.08.040 Noises Infraction 50.00
PSMC 6.08.050 Fowls at Large. Infraction 50.00
PSMC 6.08.060 Animals Near Buildings Infraction 50.00
PSMC 6.08.070 Diseased Animals. Infraction 50.00
PSMC 6.08.080 Offensive Animals on Premises. Infraction 50.00
PSMC 6.08.090 Disposal of Carcasses. Infraction 50.00
PSMC 6.08.100 Discharge of Sewage upon Ground. Infraction 50.00
PSMC 6.08.105 Animal Manure prohibited in City. Infraction 65.00
PSMC 6.08.110 Depositing or leaving of Garbage. Infraction 50.00
PSMC 6.08.120 Parking of vehicles containing Offensive | Infraction 65.00
Substances.
PSMC 6.08.130 Hauling offensive substance in defective | Infraction 65.00
vehicle.
PSMC 6.10.030 Smoking prohibited in Elevators. Infraction 50.00
PSMC 6.10.040 Smoking prohibited — Hospitals, Health | Infraction 50.00

Care and Child Care Facilities.

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 5
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSMC 6.10.050 Smoking prohibited — Public Meeting | Infraction 50.00
Rooms. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 6.10.060 Smoking prohibited - Theaters and | Infraction 50.00
Auditoriums. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 6.10.070 Smoking prohibited - Eating | Infraction 50.00
Establishments. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 6.10.080 Smoking prohibited — Department Stores. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 6.10.082 Smoking prohibited — Airport Terminals. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 6.10.090 Regulation of Smoking in the Work Place. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 6.10.100 Posting of Signs Required. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 8.04.010 Uniform Building Code Adopted Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.015 Building Code Additions, Amendments and | Infraction 75.00
Deletions. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.020 Uniform Mechanical Code Adopted. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.025 Uniform  Mechanical Code Additions, | Infraction 75.00
Amendments and Deletions. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.030 Uniform Plumbing Code Adopted. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.032 Uniform  Plumbing Code  Additions, | Infraction 75.00
Amendments and Deletions. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.055 National Electric Code Adopted. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.060 National Electric Code Additions, | Infraction 75.00
Amendments and Deletions. Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.170 Special Residential Building Provisions. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.180 Special Commercial Building Provisions. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.200 Sanitary Facilities — Construction Sites. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.210 Limitations of Uses on Construction Sites. Infraction 75.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 6
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.220 Construction Work Outside of Permitted | Infraction 100.00
Hours. Misdemeanor 200.00
Third Offense 500.00
PSMC 8.04.230 Erosion Control. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.240 Grading Requirements. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.250 Limitation of Grading Activity. Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.260 Security Protection. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 8.04.300 Permits — Licensed Contractor Required. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 8.04.401 Underground Utilities — New Construction Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.402 Underground Utilities - Existing | Infraction 75.00
Development Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.500 Uniform Fire Code Adopted Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.04.510 Uniform Fire Code, Additions, Amendments | Infraction 75.00
and Deletions Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 8.50.040 Fugitive Dust and Erosion Control, | Infraction 100.00
Violations and Penalties. (MO 7387) Misdemeanor 200.00
Third Offense 1,000.00
PSZ0O 9200.01 Permitted Uses G-R-5 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9200.02 Uses Prohibited G-R-5 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9200.03 Property Development Standards G-R-5 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9200.04 Property Maintenance Standards G-R-5 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZz0O 9201.01 Permitted Uses R-1 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9201.02 Uses Prohibited R-1 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 7
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9201.03 Property Development Standards R-1 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9201.04 Property Maintenance Standards R-1 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9202.01 Permitted Uses R-G-A Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9202.02 Uses Prohibited R-G-A Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9202.03 Property Development Standards R-G-A | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9202.04 Performance Standards R-G-A Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9202.05 Property Maintenance Standards R-G-A | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9203.01 Permitted Uses R-2 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9203.02 Uses Prohibited R-2 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9203.03 Property Development Standards R-2 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9203.04 Performance Standards R-2 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9203.05 Property Maintenance Standards R-2 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9204.01 Permitted Uses R-3 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9204.02 Uses Prohibited R-3 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9204.03 Property Development Standards R-3 | Infraction 50.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 8
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9204.04 Performance Standards R-3 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9204.05 Property Maintenance Standards R-3 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9205.01 Permitted Uses R-4 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9205.02 Uses Prohibited R-4 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9205.03 Property Development Standards R-4 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9205.04 Performance Standards R-4 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9205.05 Property Maintenance Standards R-4 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9206.01 Permitted Uses R-4-VP Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9206.02 Uses Prohibited R-4-VP Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9206.03 Property Development Standards R-4-VP | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9206.04 Performance Standards R-4-VP Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9206.05 Property Maintenance Standards R-4-VP | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9207.01 Permitted Uses R-MHP Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSz0O 9207.02 Uses Prohibited R-MHP Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 9
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSZ0 9207.03 Property Development Standards R-MHP | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9207.04 Property Development Standards within the | Infraction 50.00
Mobilehome Park. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9207.05 Property Maintenance Standards R-MHP | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9208.01 Permitted Uses P Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9208.02 Uses Prohibited P Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9208.03 Property Development Standards P Zone. | Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9208.04 Performance Standards P Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9208.05 Property Maintenance Standards P Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9209.01 Permitted Uses C-B-D Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9209.02 Uses Prohibited C-B-D Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9209.03 Property Development Standards C-B-D | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9209.04 Performance Standards C-B-D Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9209.05 Property Maintenance Standards C-B-D | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9210.01 Permitted Uses C-D-N Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 10
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSZz0O 9210.02 Uses Prohibited C-D-N Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9210.03 Property Development Standards C-D-N | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9210.04 Performance Standards C-D-N Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9210.05 Property Maintenance Standards C-B-D | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSz0O 9211.01 Permitted Uses C-S-C Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9211.02 Uses Prohibited C-S-C Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9211.03 Property Development Standards C-S-C | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9211.04 Performance Standards C-S-C Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9211.05 Property Maintenance Standards C-S-C | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9212.01 Permitted Uses C-1 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9212.02 Uses Prohibited C-1 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9212.03 Property Development Standards C-1 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9212.04 Property Maintenance Standards C-1 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSz0O 9213.01 Permitted Uses C-1AA Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 11
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSZz0O 9213.02 Uses Prohibited C-1AA Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9213.03 Property Development Standards C-1AA | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9213.04 Performance Standards C-1AA Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9213.05 Property Maintenance Standards C-1AA | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9214.01 Permitted Uses C-2 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9214.02 Uses prohibited C-2 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9214.03 Property Development Standards C-2 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9214.04 Property Maintenance Standards C-2 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSz0O 9215.01 Permitted Uses C-M Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9215.02 Uses Prohibited C-M Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9215.03 Property Development Standards C-M | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9215.04 Property Maintenance Standards C-M | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9216.01 Permitted Uses M-1-P Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9216.02 Uses Prohibited M-1-P Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 12
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSZ0 9216.03 Property Development Standards M-1-P | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9216.04 Performance Standards M-1-P Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9216.05 Property Maintenance Standards M-1-P | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9217.01 Permitted Uses M-1 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9217.02 Uses Prohibited M-1 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9217.03 Property Development Standards M-1 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9271.04 Performance Standards M-1 Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9217.05 Property Maintenance Standards M-1 | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSz0O 9218.01 Permitted Uses A Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9218.02 Uses Prohibited A Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9218.03 Property Development Standards A Zone. | Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9218.04 Property Maintenance Standards A Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9219.00 Noise Impact Zone Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSz0O 9220.01 Uses Permitted W Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 13
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSz0O 9220.02 Uses Prohibited W Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9220.03 Property Development Standards W Zone. | Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9220.04 Property Maintenance Standards W Zone. | Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9221.01 Permitted Uses O Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9221.02 Uses Prohibited O Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9221.03 Property Development Standards O Zone. | Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9221.04 Property Maintenance Standards O Zone. | Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9222.01 Permitted Uses U-R Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9222.02 Conditions and Procedures U-R Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9222.03 Property Development Standards U-R | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9222.04 Property Maintenance Standards U-R | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9223.01 Permitted Uses CC Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9223.02 Uses Prohibited CC Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9223.03 Property Development Standards CC | Infraction 50.00
Zone. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 14
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSZ0 9224.00 Historic Preservation Combining Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9225.00 Resort Overlay Zone. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9300.00 General Conditions. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9301.00 Yards Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9301.01 Tennis Courts Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9301.02 Special Set-backs Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9302.00 Walls, Fences, and Landscaping Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9303.00 Building Height. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9305.00 Vehicular Access. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9306.00 Off-street Parking Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9307.00 Off-street Loading and Trash Enclosures Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9308.00 Antennas. Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9309.00 Building Permits/Dedication and Infraction 50.00
Improvement. Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9313.00 Hillside Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 15
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail
PSZ0O 9314.00 Child Care Facilities Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9315.00 Time Share Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9316.00 Video Amusement Arcades Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9317.00 Flood Damage Prevention Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9318.00 Accessory Apartment Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9319.00 Property Maintenance Standards Infraction 53.00
Misdemeanor 68.00
Third Offense 83.00
PSZ0 9320.00 Signs Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9400.00 Uses Permitted Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9402.00 Conditional Use Permit Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0O 9404.00 Architectural Review Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZO 9405.00 Nonconformance Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSZ0 9408.00 Development Agreements Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 9.60.030 Standards of Design and Improvement Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 9.60.040 On-site Development Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 10.08.010 Animal License Required Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 16
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSMC 10.08.060 Anti-Rabies Vaccination Required Infraction 25.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.08.080 Tag — Attachment Required Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.08.090 Tag — Display Required Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.08.100 Tag — Removal Prohibited Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.08.110 Duplicate Tag Required Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.12.030 Interference with Animal Control duties Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 10.12.040 Animals at-large in Aircraft Operations area | Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 10.16.010 Biting Animals — Quarantine Orders Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 10.16.020 Dying on Quarantine Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 10.16.030 Knowledge of Bite — Duty to Report Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 10.16.040 Bitten Animals Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 10.16.070 Proof of Rabies Vaccination Infraction 25.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.20.090 Dangerous Animals Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 10.22.020 Unattended Animals in Vehicle Infraction 88.00
Misdemeanor 113.00
PSMC 10.24.010 Female Dogs to be Confined during | Infraction 40.00
Breeding Period Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.24.015 Wild Animals — Authorization Required Infraction 35.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.24.020 Wild Animals to be Confined Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
PSMC 10.24.030 Kennels subject to Zoning and Health | Infraction 40.00
Regulations Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.28.010 Dogs Running at-large Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00

Prepared by:

Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 17
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail
Third Offense 65.00
PSMC 10.28.020 Noise Disturbances by Animals Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
Third Offense 65.00
PSMC 10.28.025 Dog Defecation to be removed by Owner Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.28.030 Retention of Dog by other than Owner Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.28.040 Unauthorized removal of Animal from | Infraction 40.00
Pound Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.28.050 Dogs at Public Schools Prohibited Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 10.28.060 Interference with Police Dogs Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 85.00
PSMC 11.04.030 Sleeping in Vehicles Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
PSMC 11.08.005 Consumption of Alcohol and Possession of | Infraction 100.00
Open Container in public Misdemeanor 200.00
Third Offense 300.00
PSMC 11.08.007 Consumption of Alcohol on Hotel Grounds | Infraction 100.00
prohibited from 11:00 PM to 6:00 AM Misdemeanor 200.00
Third Offense 300.00
PSMC 11.08.040 Loud Noise Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 60.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.08.080 Trespass — Entering or Refusing to leave | Infraction 40.00
Public or Private property Misdemeanor 60.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.10.040 Public Nudity Prohibited Infraction 100.00
Misdemeanor 200.00
Third Offense 300.00
PSMC 11.32.180 Domestic Dogs on Golf Course Infraction 50.00
PSMC 11.32.190 Molesting Wild Animals Infraction 50.00
PSMC 11.33.050 Unauthorized Access to Airfield Infraction 75.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06) Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 11.33.060 Unrestrained Animals Prohibited — Airport | Infraction 75.00
Property Misdemeanor 100.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06)
PSMC 11.33.070 Unauthorized Business Prohibited — Airport | Infraction 75.00
Property Misdemeanor 100.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06)
PSMC 11.33.080 Unauthorized Parking — Airport Property Infraction 53.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06) Misdemeanor 63.00

Prepared by:

Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 18
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail
Third Offense 73.00
PSMC 11.34.050 Solicitation Prohibited — Airport Property Infraction 50.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06) Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.34.070 Loading and Unloading Passengers - | Infraction 35.00
Airport Misdemeanor 60.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06)
PSMC 11.34.080 Signs and Insignias — Airport Infraction 35.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06) Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 11.34.090 Way Bills — Airport Infraction 25.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06) Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 11.34.100 Notification of Arrivals — Airport Infraction 25.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06) Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 11.34.110 Meeters and Greeters Infraction 35.00
(Repealed by Ord. 1693 adopted 7/19/06) Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 11.36.010 Wildlife Protected Infraction 40.00
Misdemeanor 50.00
PSMC 11.40.015 Camping and Storage in Public Areas Infraction 100.00
(Ord. 1696)
PSMC 11.40.020 Unauthorized Camping by Minor Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
PSMC 11.40.030 Unauthorized Camping by Adult Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
PSMC 11.44.030 Exclusion of Public from Specific Areas Infraction 100.00
(Ord. 1696)
PSMC 11.44.040 Permit Required Infraction 100.00
(Ord. 1696)
PSMC 11.44.050 Rules and Regulations Infraction 100.00
Park/Recreation Area/Community Center
(Ord. 1696)
PSMC 11.44.060 Prohibited Conduct in Parks Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
PSMC 11.44.065 Prohibited Conduct in Parks (Ord. 1696) Infraction 100.00
PSMC 11.56.010 Curfew Infraction 50.00
(MO 7166) Misdemeanor 75.00
Third Offense 100.00
PSMC 11.60.030 Minors Renting Hotel Room Infraction 65.00
Misdemeanor 80.00
PSMC 11.64.010 Trespass — Remaining on private property | Infraction 50.00
after notification to leave Misdemeanor 60.00
Third Offense 80.00

Prepared by:

Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 19
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSMC 11.64.020 Trespass — Entering property after | Infraction 50.00
notification to keep off or away Misdemeanor 60.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.68.140 Solicitation Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.70.020 Sale of Spray Paint to Minors Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.70.030 Possession of Spray Paint in Public Place | Infraction 50.00
Prohibited Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.70.040 Possession of Spray Paint in Public Place | Infraction 50.00
prohibited by Minors Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.70.050 Graffiti — Prohibited Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.72.020 Fire Hazards — Brush Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.72.030 Refuse and Waste Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.72.050 Polluted Water Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.72.090 Building Code Violations Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 11.72.100 Uniform Housing Code Violations Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 11.72.130 Hazardous Obstruction Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 11.72.140 Hazardous Corner Obstruction Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 11.72.150 Excessive Plant Growth Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 11.72.160 Deteriorating and Defective Structures Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 11.72.170 Property Maintenance Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00

Prepared by:

Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 20
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail
PSMC 11.72.180 Right of Entry Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 11.74.041 Noise — Controlled Hours of Operation Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 11.74.043 Noise — Loud and Unusual Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 11.80.010 Abandoned Vehicle Infraction 31.00
PSMC 11.96.020 lllegal Storage Infraction 88.00
PSMC 11.96.020 RV and Commercial Vehicle Parking in | Infraction 88.00
Residential Zone Misdemeanor 113.00
PSMC 11.96.030 Living in Vehicle Prohibited Infraction 75.00
PSMC 12.28.050 (1) Display of “For Sale” Sign Infraction 35.00
PSMC 12.28.050 (2) Repair of Vehicle on Roadway Infraction 88.00
Misdemeanor 113.00
PSMC 12.28.060 Parallel-Over 18” from Curb Infraction 35.00
PSMC 12.28.090 Posted No Parking (Anytime) Infraction 35.00
PSMC 12.28.100 Noisemaking Devices Prohibited Infraction 24.00
(MO 6219)
PSMC 12.28.110 (b) Temporary No Parking Sign 37.00
PSMC 12.28.130 (b) Parking on Private Property (Without | Infraction 37.00
Permission)
PSMC 12.28.130 (c3) | Private Property Infraction 35.00
PSMC 12.28.130 (c4) | Private Property-Reserved Infraction 43.00
PSMC 12.28.130 (c5) | Private Property-Shopping Ctr./Business Infraction 35.00
PSMC 12.28.130 (c7) | Handicapped Zone Infraction 288.00
PSMC 12.28.130 (c8) | Private Property-Red Zone Infraction 59.00
PSMC 12.28.140 Locking Ignition Required Infraction 24.00
PSMC 12.32.010 Time Limited Parking Infraction 35.00
PSMC 12.32.030 Parking Using more than one space Infraction 31.00
PSMC 12.32.040 No Parking — Midnight to 6:00 AM. Infraction 37.00
PSMC 12.32.050 Patron Parking Only Infraction 35.00
PSMC 12.32.060 City Hall Parking Lot Infraction 37.00
PSMC 12.32.070 Staff Parking Only Infraction 35.00
PSMC 12.32.080 No Parking Areas/Improper Parking Infraction 31.00
PSMC 12.32.080.5 Parked Causing Hazard/Endangerment Infraction 31.00
PSMC 12.32.100 Red Zone Infraction 41.00
PSMC 12.32.100 Yellow Zone(7:00 AM to 6:00 PM) Infraction 41.00
PSMC 12.32.100 White Zone(7:00 AM to 6:00 PM) Infraction 41.00
PSMC 12.32.100 White Zone (Airport/Hotel/Taxi) Infraction 41.00
PSMC 12.32.100 Green Zone(9:00 AM to 6:00 PM) Infraction 41.00
PSMC 12.40.020 Meter/Reserved/Airport Parking Infraction 35.00
PSMC 12.40.040 Employee Parking Only — Airport Infraction 43.00
PSMC 12.60.070 In Passenger Loading Zone Infraction 43.00

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 21
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

PSMC 12.64.040 Bicycle on Sidewalk Infraction 50.00
PSMC 12.64.110 Roller Skates Infraction 50.00
PSMC 12.72.030 Walking/Riding — Public Property Infraction 25.00
PSMC 12.72.050 Horses — Pavement Infraction 25.00
PSMC 12.80.010 Operating Vehicle on Street after Street | Infraction 50.00
Closure Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 14.04.100 Size and Placement of Street Numbers Infraction 25.00
PSMC 14.16.040 Encroachments — Acts Requiring Permits Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 14.16.160 Display of Permits Infraction 25.00
PSMC 14.16.170 Change in Permit Infraction 25.00
PSMC 14.16.250 Erection and Maintenance of Safety | Infraction 75.00
Provisions Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 14.16.260 Notification of Beginning Work Infraction 60.00
Misdemeanor 75.00
PSMC 14.16.280 Care of Drainage Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 14.16.290 Interference with Travel of General Public Infraction 60.00
Misdemeanor 75.00
PSMC 14.16.330 Storage of Material Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 14.16.420 Hedges or Fences in Right-of-Way | Infraction 60.00
Permits/Obstructions Misdemeanor 75.00
PSMC 14.20.020 Moving Buildings — Permit Required Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 14.20.210 Moving Buildings — Lighting Required Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 14.24.010 Sweeping/Washing debris or petroleum | Infraction 60.00
into Streets Misdemeanor 75.00
PSMC 14.24.020 Permitting water to flow into Street Infraction 60.00
Misdemeanor 75.00
PSMC 14.24.060 Drainage of Swimming Pools — Permit | Infraction 60.00
Required Misdemeanor 75.00
PSMC 15.20.010 Sewer Connection/Alteration — Permit | Infraction 50.00
Required Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 15.28.010 Dumping of Objectionable Waste Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 15.28.020 Discharge of Polluted Water Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00

Prepared by:

Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs

Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 22
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail
PSMC 15.28.040 Discharge of Unpolluted Water Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 15.28.050 Unpolluted Drainage Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 15.28.060 Unpolluted Industrial Water Infraction 50.00
Misdemeanor 65.00
Third Offense 80.00
PSMC 15.28.070 Prohibited Waste Infraction 75.00
Misdemeanor 100.00
PSMC 15.28.180 Tampering with Sewers Infraction 60.00
Misdemeanor 75.00
PSMC 16.34.045 Parking or Stopping Infraction 53.00
PSMC 16.34.050 Unauthorized Parking/Airport Property Infraction 53.00
CVC 4000(a) No Registration (no correction) Infraction 33.00
CVC 5094 Expired Registration Tabs (no correction) Infraction 75.00
(*R22588)
CVvC 5200 Front/Rear License Plate Req. Infraction 69.00
CVC 5202 No License Plate Infraction 72.00
CVC 5204 Expired Registration Tabs Infraction 78.00
CVvC 21113 Parking on Public Grounds Infraction 46.00
CVC 21458(a) No Parking Zone Infraction 31.00
CVC 22500.1 Parking in Fire Lane Infraction 47.00
CVC 22500(a) Parking within an Intersection Infraction 63.00
CVC 22500(b) Parking on Crosswalk Infraction 63.00
CVC 22500(d) Parking within 15’ of Fire Station Driveway | Infraction 63.00
CVC 22500(e) Blocking Driveway Infraction 63.00
CVC 22500(f) Parking on Sidewalk Infraction 63.00
CVC 22500(g) Parked next to Road Construction Infraction 63.00
CVC 22500(h) Double Parked Infraction 63.00
CVC 22500(i) Parking in Bus Zone Infraction 59.00
CVC 22500() Parked blocking a Wheelchair Ramp Infraction 57.00
CVC 22502(a) Parallel 18” from curb Infraction 43.00
CVC 22505 State Highway Parking Infraction 43.00
CVC 22507.8(c2) Handicapped Loading Zone/Parked in | Infraction 113.00
Crosshatched Lines
CVC 22511.1(a)—(b) Parking/Standing in Space for Charging | Civil Fine 41.00
Electric Vehicle While Not Connected for
Charging Purposes
CVC 22511.1(a)—(b) Parking/Standing in Space for Charging | Infraction 100.00

Electric Vehicle While Not Connected for
Charging Purposes

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




City of Palm Springs
Bail Schedule Revised April 2021

Page 23
Code Section Description Violation Type Bail

CVC 22514 Parking within 15’ of Fire Hydrant Infraction 63.00

CVC 22515(a) Unattended/Motor Running Infraction 63.00

CVC 22515(b) Unattended with Engine Running Infraction 63.00

CVC 22522 Parking near Sidewalk Access Ramp Infraction 57.00

CVC 22651(n) Temp. Posted No Parking Infraction 31.00

CVC 22651(n) Temp Posted No Parking Infraction 31.00

CVC 26700 Cracked Windshield — Correction Required | Infraction 18.00
MO6219

CVC 26709 Missing Sideview Mirror — Correction | Infraction 18.00
Required

Ed. Note. Any violation not specifically listed in the City of Palm Springs Bail Schedule would be
subject to the provisions of PSMC Section 1.01.155 for an Infraction penalty and PSMC Section
1.01.160 for a Misdemeanor penalty.

1.01.155 Infraction penalty.
Any person convicted of an infraction for violation of an ordinance of the city is punishable by:

(1) Afine not exceeding one hundred dollars for a first violation;

(2) A fine not exceeding two hundred dollars for a second violation of the same
ordinance within one year;

(3) Afine not exceeding five hundred dollars for each additional violation of the same
ordinance within one year.

1.01.160 Misdemeanor penalty.

Any person convicted of a misdemeanor under the provisions of this code (unless
otherwise provided herein) shall be punishable by a fine of not more than one thousand dollars
or by imprisonment in the city jail or in the Riverside County jail for a period of not more than
six months, or by both such fine and imprisonment.

*Resolution No. 22588, adopted 9/2/09, authorizes automatic modification of the Bail Schedule when
the State of California modifies, amends and/or adds new statutorily required pass-thru penalties for a
parking offense.

Prepared by:
Office of the City Clerk




